
From: R4_Regional_Hearing_Clerk
To: Williams, Stephen; R4_Regional_Hearing_Clerk; Devkota, Om
Cc: Hendrix, Cary; Rago, Robert J
Subject: RE: Docket EPCRA-04-2021-0604(b) - Ferrara Candy Company - Louisville, KY Bakery
Date: Thursday, August 26, 2021 7:38:00 AM
Attachments: image004.png

Good morning Mr. Williams,
 
Thank you.
 
Have a pleasant day!
 
Kind regards,
 
 
Shannon L.Richardson
Shannon L. Richardson | Region 4 RHC
Paralegal Specialist
General/Criminal Law & Cross-Office Support
U.S. Environmental Protection Agency | Region 4
61 Forsyth Street, Atlanta, GA. 30303
Office: 404.562.8929 |
 
From: Williams, Stephen <stephen.williams@ferrarausa.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, August 25, 2021 4:35 PM
To: R4_Regional_Hearing_Clerk <R4_Regional_Hearing_Clerk@epa.gov>; Devkota, Om <devkota.om@epa.gov>
Cc: Hendrix, Cary <cary.hendrix@ferrarausa.com>; Rago, Robert J <bob.rago@ferrarausa.com>
Subject: Docket EPCRA-04-2021-0604(b) - Ferrara Candy Company - Louisville, KY Bakery
 
Attn:
Regional Hearing Clerk
U.S. EPA, Region 4
61 Forsyth Street, S.W.
Atlanta, Georgia 30303-8960
 
And
 
Attn: Om P. Devkota
Enforcement and Compliance Assurance Division
U.S. EPA Region 4
61 Forsyth Street, S.W.
Atlanta, Georgia 30303-8960
 
Please let this communication meet the proof of payment requirement as outlined in the Consent Agreement.  Both payments will be transacted
prior to the 9/1/2021 deadline.  One is scheduled to be transacted on 8/26/21, the other 8/30/21.
 
If you require additional information, please respond to this message or feel free to contact my cell at (502) 396-9765.
 
 
Stephen A. Williams, CSP
EHS Manager
Louisville, KY – Bakery
2287 Ralph Avenue
Louisville, KY  40216
C: (502) 396-9765
Stephen.williams@ferrarausa.com

 
 
 
 

From: Fisher, Samantha 
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Vendor
Company Code

20910

FERQ

Name 0.5 ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY
city RIVERDALE
vear| period|account |meference  |DocumentNo|syps  |Doc. Date |DD|amount in local cur.|icurr|
@ 2021 o|2010 |epcra-04-2020-06| 15001675 |km 08/24/2021 6,217.00-|usp
7 @202 8|20010 EPCRA-04-2020  |19001680 |KR 08/15/2021 1,553.00-|usD
e e e e






Sent: Tuesday, August 24, 2021 1:18 PM
To: Williams, Stephen <stephen.williams@ferrarausa.com>; Rago, Robert J <bob.rago@ferrarausa.com>; Corrigan, Catherine
<catherine.corrigan@ferrarausa.com>
Cc: Hendrix, Cary <cary.hendrix@ferrarausa.com>
Subject: RE: EPA Account Set Up for Fine Payment
 
Stephen-
 
Please find below report showing both fines as processed.
 

 
Warm regards,
Samantha
 
Samantha Fisher
Accounts Payable Specialist - Cookies
Ferrara Candy Company
404 W. Harrison St., Suite 650
Chicago, IL 60607
Mobile:  224-703-0781
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